
Resurrection Appearances Prophecy

Mary and Mary bought spices to anoint 
Jesus after the Sabbath (Mark 16:1) - they 
prepared the spices (Luke 24:1)

First day of the week (Sunday) as it began 
to dawn - they came to look at the grave 
(Mt 28:1) - Who is going to move the 
stone? (Mark 16:3)

earthquake - an angel rolled away the 
stone and sat on it (Mt 28:2)

There was no body in the tomb (Luke 
24:3)

angels appear (2?)
fear not, why do you look for the living 
among the dead? He is not here, He has 
risen as He said He would
(Mt 28:5-8; Mk 16:5-8; Lk 24:4-8)

The women fled (Mk 16:8)

Guards shook with fear and fell as dead 
men (Mt 28:4)

The women go back to tell the disciples 
and the others (Lk 24:9-12)

Most of the disciples didn’t believe them

Peter and John run for the tomb (Jn 
20:2-10) saw the linen - no body - went 
home

Mary Magdalene - encounters Jesus at the 
tomb

Jesus says that He will ascend to the 
Father and she was to go back (Jn 
20:11-18)

Mary tells the disciples that she talked to 
the Lord 

The brethren were to go to Galilee and 
Jesus would met them there (Mt 28:9-10)

Guards are bribed to say that the disciples 
came and stole the body while they were 
asleep (Mt 28:11-15)

Jesus appears to the two men on their to 
Emmaus (Lk 24:13-32)

Mark 16:14 - Jesus reproached the 
disciples for not believing those who had 
seen Him

Jesus shows them His wounds (Luke 
24:36-43)

Thomas won’t believe unless he touches 
Him (John 20:19-25)

Thomas touched Jesus (John 20:26-29)

I Cor 15:1-22 - what the gospel is

Mark 8:31 - elders, chief priests, and 
scribes turned Him over, killed, raised on 
the 3rd day (9:31-32) 

Matthew 16:21 - He would go to Jerusalem 
- then be killed

John 2:18-22 - the temple would be raised 
in 3 days

Rom 4:22-25 - Jesus was put to death for 
our transgressions and raised up for our 
justification

Rom 6:4-11 - baptized into His death - 
taking our identity from Him

I John 3:2 - we will be like Him when we 
are resurrected from the dead

Lesson 28 - Chapter 20 - The Resurrection


